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Hi ,
 
No worries and thank you for letting us know. Perhaps we can discuss again next year.
 
Kind regards,
 

Phone 
Email            

Cross Government Services Branch
CORPORATE AND CROSS GOVERNMENT SERVICES DIVISION
cid:image003.jpg@01D6B8F1.1C6F3E90

Louisa Lawson Building, 25 Cowlishaw St Greenway ACT 2900
 

From: HR Assist Mailbox  
Sent: Thursday, 4 May 2023 11:02 AM
To: 
Cc: 
Subject: RE: For Action: IAP Agreement Letter 2023 (ACMA) [SEC=OFFICIAL]
 
 
Caution: Do not click any links or open any attachments unless you trust the sender and
believe the content to be safe.

Hi 
 
After discussion with our SES, we won’t be proceeding with the IAP program this year. Primarily
around cost is the reason but we will review and look at it again next year.
 
Thanks for all your help and best of luck with it all
 
 
Warm regards
 

Assistant Manager
Payroll, Recruitment and Entry Level Programs
 
_____________________________

Australian Communications and Media Authority



acma.gov.au

      

The ACMA acknowledges the Traditional Owners of Country throughout Australia and their continuing
connection to land, culture and community. We pay our respects to Elders past, present and future.
 
 
 
 

From:  On Behalf Of
CROSS.GOVERNMENT.SERVICES
Sent: Thursday, 4 May 2023 10:56 AM
To: 
Cc: 

Subject: RE: For Action: IAP Agreement Letter 2023 (ACMA) [SEC=OFFICIAL]
 
Hi and team,
 
I am just wondering if you have been able to progress this on your end, as we do require this
agreement letter prior to undertaking work and issuing any invoices.
 
Thanks very much and please let us know if there is any concern.
 
Kind regards,
 

Phone 
Email            

Cross Government Services Branch
CORPORATE AND CROSS GOVERNMENT SERVICES DIVISION

Louisa Lawson Building, 25 Cowlishaw St Greenway ACT 2900
 

From:  
Sent: Friday, 21 April 2023 4:09 PM
To: 
Cc: 

Subject: FW: For Action: IAP Agreement Letter 2023 (ACMA) [SEC=OFFICIAL]
 
Hi team,
 



Are you able to assist in Maria’s absence?
 
Kind regards,
 

Email            

Cross Government Services Branch
CORPORATE AND CROSS GOVERNMENT SERVICES DIVISION

Louisa Lawson Building, 25 Cowlishaw St Greenway ACT 2900
 

From:  
Sent: Friday, 21 April 2023 4:05 PM

 
Cc: 
Subject: For Action: IAP Agreement Letter 2023 (ACMA) [SEC=OFFICIAL]
 
Hi 
 
Please find attached, the agreement letter to formalise your participation in the Australian
Government Indigenous Apprenticeship Program for 2023.
 
Please note program fees for the service below:
 

fees associated with the recruitment of apprentices and the completion of
confirmation of heritage checks for each candidate is $4,440.05. This invoice will be
issued within 30 days of the Letter of Exchange being signed

fees associated with the ongoing management of the apprentices that commence in
the Program $7,759.15 per apprentice that commences. This invoice will be issued
in June/July 2023

All program fees are calculated on a cost recovery basis.

It would be appreciated if you could arrange countersignature and return to
by COB Friday 28 April 2023.

 
Please do not hesitate to contact us if you would like to discuss.
 
Kind regards,
 

Phone 
Email            

Cross Government Services Branch
CORPORATE AND CROSS GOVERNMENT SERVICES DIVISION






